PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT PURCHASE REQUEST FORM
Purchase Requisition Number/PO #:
Division: FLEET SERVICES [ Vendor 1 ] [ Vendor 2 ] [ Vendor 3
Emg of Request: 10/1/2018 Company:  RING POWER CORPORATION  Company: Company:
Requested By: MATTHEW CASE Contact: BERT HAMMETT Contact: Contact:
. 5020012201
Account Key / Object Code:
Phong #: 941-809-2013 Phone #: Phone #:
!/ ( Fax ¥ Fax # Fax #
REPLACEMENT FOR ASSETS: 54107 & 541
Vendor # Vendor # Vendor #
. Blanket | FLORIDA SHERRIFS CONTRACT FAS1B! ket Blanket
Stock or Special Order: STOCK NON-STOCK __ o R S I L g s
Unit of
Hem # Measure Oty Units Unit Price Total Units Unit Price Total Units | Unit Price Total
NEW CATERPWLLAR D8T DOZER, DOMESTIC
INSTRUCTION, ENGLISH AFTERTREATMENT FILM,
WASTE HANDLER ARRANGEMENT, DEBRIS RADIATOR
16.35FP), GUARDED FINAL DRIVE, THERMAL WRAPPED
|IENGINE, SCREEN PRECLEANER, STANDARD BRAKES,
|LGP POWERED BOTTOM GROUND GUAGE, GUARDED
UNDER CARRIAGE, 38° TRACK, NO CARRIER AOLLERS,
SINGLE TLT LINES, SINGLE TILT REVERSING FAN,
HYDRAULICS, HEAVY DUTY BATTERIES, 150AMP
DUCTED ALTERNATOR, PREMIUM REAR SCREEN
LIGHTS, DUAL PANE CAB, HEATED AND VENTHATED
SEAT, AMFM RADIO, QUICK OPENING OPERATORS AR,
SINGLE TLT ARO, CELLULAR PRODUCT LINK,
STANDARD FUEL SYSTEM, POWERED /SEALED HEAVY
DUTY BOTTOM GUARDS, REAR STRIKER BAR, HIGH
SPEED OIL CHANGE SYSTEM, STANDARD FLUIDS,
STANDARD ENGINE COOLANT, CYLINDER ROD FLUID
PROTECTION FILM, ENGLISH MANUAL, WARNING
STROBE LKSHT AND MOUNT, VISIBILITY CAMERA, FUEL
TANK GUARD, FAN DEBRIS GUARD, GRLL DEBRIS
GUARD, REAR SCREEN, ADDITIONAL COUNTER
WEIGHTS. BASIC LIFT CYLINDERS, BSUA GUARDED
BULL DOZER, BSU LGP LANDFILL BLADE, SINGLE
EXTREME PUSH ARMS, FURNISH AND INSTALL |
[TRIMBLE SYSTEM, FIRE SUPPRESSION SYSTEM, |
SERVICE MANUAL AND PARTS BOOK. SYEAR/7500 | |
HOUR PREMIER WARRANTY INCLUDING DELIVERY |
1 EA 1 AND SET UP TO MANATEE COUNTY FLEET EA |$ 868.862.00| § 868.862.00 5 R s
[VENDOR CONTACT |
This section was - NAVE BERT HAMMETT
requested by CONTACT NUMBER & | ... - G POWER QO
Purchasing to be [EMAL: BEAT HAMMETT SRHGPOWER JOM
entered into the  [FiEET conTACT [
sheet and IFAS.  [NAME: MATTHEW/CASE
Please fill in CONTACTNUMBER  [341-708.7458 €XT 7417
information and do |ANDEMAIL: MATTHEW.CASE @M YMANATEE.ORG
not {
frofn shest. QUOTE NUMBER: NA W7
QUOTE DATED: 10172008 4~ [
THE HOURS OF 8:00AM AND 4:00PM, MONDAY THRU
FRIDAY TO: MANATEE COUNTY FLEET SERVICES,
1100 26TH AVE EAST, BRADENTON, FL 34208
NOTE: "MANATEE COUNTY BOCC" MUST BE LISTED
AS THE OWNER ON VENDOR INVOICES,
APPLICATIONS FOR TITLES AND CERTIFICATIONS OF i
lomem, — s .8 s s =
Please attach copies of the bid or contract that is being used for this vehicle buy.
$ 660,862.00  $ 866,862.00 Si 5 - $
* Plaase indicate whether shipping Is included, nol sppiicable or additional cosl. Freight| $ - s - Freight 5 Freight $
Total Cost| $ 868,862.00 | $ 868,862.00 Total Cost k] - Total Cost | § -
PER ITEM TOTAL Notas / Reason for Purchass;
Identily Reason
IFor purchases between $700.81 and $5.000 which are not compatitively bid, identify the exception to the regulsed compstitive purchase ld,z\!lelxcRe:;]on /
imﬂm for exceplion | gep) ACEMENT TO FUND# 4800010900 FOR ASSET# 54107 & 54109
ASSET 54107 & 54109 TO BE DECOMMISIONED FOR DISPOSAL WHEN REPLACEMENT
n ARRIVES,
(The cost of wauld excesd any potentlal savings and benefit to the County. (Compliss with Small
Purchase Category One F Section 6.b., affactive 08/06/12)
@ |Scle Source: Complete Sols Source/Noncompatitive Request Form
(3) |Sole Source: (OEM) Onty - Must have documsntation on flle. |Exception to the standard practi g quotes: For p less than $2,500.00, the
(4) H - o i |Department Director, or designes, is o proceed wi when the
f 5 costs of such ng regdarly of secunng of services
1= Requiies Supactonmteiineinut of oid parts - Requires Anad competRion suthorizaton otfciany, or, atr noad, tma avaiablo and famianty with tho markal o ha cormmocktes or
fi ¥ arcl services ko be acquired, that competton is not required.
T [ TRpAlITpa Source - Mequites ARG compeliion authorLEalion
"’_ [BCC Ordinance No. 2-26-43 Pure| Al ive Standards & Procedur: iual) - Must attach suj =
| ® |documentation, Approval Signature:
7

C:\Users\imcase\Desktop\54107 and 54109 replacement po req 10.11,18.xds




Ring Power:

Ring Power Corporation
500 World Commerce Parkway
St. Augustine, FL 32092

QUOTE PER THE FLORIDA SHERIFF'S ASSOCIATION CONTRACT

Quote Prepared For: 10/1/2018
Manatee County
— AV R
(1) NEW CATERPILLAR D8T TRACK TYPE TRACTOR

CONTRACT DETAILS

Florida Sheriff's Association

Bid # FSA18-VEH16.0

Specification # 39, 180 HP Bulldozer Canopy Tractor and Options

Effective: October 1, 2018 Through September 30, 2019

CONTRACT PRICING

Base Caterpillar D6T XL VPAT as Specified in Contract $341,604 v
442-1100 Upgrade to D8T Base Machine Only $247,077 v
TOTAL OF CONTRACT PRICING $588,681 v

NON-SPECIFIED OPTIONS
379-0290 INSTRUCTION, DOMESTIC NC vV~
382-7710 FILM, AFTERTREATMENT, ENGLISH NC v
442-1081 WASTE HANDLING ARRANGEMENT $6,080v~
423-4626 RADIATOR, 6.35 FPI, DEBRIS NC -
384-4608 FINAL DRIVE, LGP, GUARDED $15,960 «
442-1061 ENGINE, THERMAL WRAPPED $12,880 v~
543-5218 PRECLEANER, WITH SCREEN $1,340 v~
463-0215 BRAKES, BASIC NC
510-1189 GAUGE, LGP POWERED BOTTOM GRD $21,030~
379-0277 UNDERCARRIAGE, PPR SUS GUARDED $4,595 v~
384-2987 TRACK, 965MM / 38" ES, TRAP PPR $18,270
385-4734 NO CARRIER ROLLERS NC v~
465-8163 LINES, SINGLE TILT NC v~
386-7529 FAN, REVERSING, SINGLE TILT NC
525-1183 HYDRAULICS, $5,020 v
384-8305 BATTERIES, HEAVY DUTY NC v~
530-3046 ALTERNATOR, 150 AMP, DUCTED $477 v
469-6284 HEATER, ENGINE COOLANT (120V) NC
449-3769 LIGHTS, PREMIUM, REAR SCREEN $3,875 v
516-3359 CAB AR, DUAL PANE $6,250




393-7245 SEAT, HEATED & VENTILATED $1,630v"
487-5821 RADIO, AM/FM NC v~
423-9556 OPERATORS AR, QUICK OPENING $615 o~
442-1093 ARO, SINGLE TILT $5,730 v~
486-7008 PRODUCT LINK, CELLULAR PL641 NC v~
388-9402 FUEL SYSTEM, STANDARD NC «
525-1194 GUARDS, BOTTOM, POWERED SEALED HD $15,650 v~
209-5100 BAR, REAR STRIKER $18,020 v~
468-1113 - OIL CHANGE SYSTEM, HIGH SPEED $855 «
379-0292 FLUIDS, STANDARD NC v*
382-5934 ENGINE COOLANT, STD {-37C) NC VvV
0P-3940 CYLINDER ROD FLUID FILM PROTEC NC «
0P-0996 MANUAL, ENGLISH NC «
510-4941 LIGHT, WARNING STROBE $1,015 v
384-8720 MOUNT, LIGHT, WARNING STROBE $191 v~
510-4950 VISIBILITY AR, CAMERA $2,730
467-7340 GUARD, FUEL TANK $3,030 v~
238-9658 GUARD, FAN DEBRIS $940 v~
450-7429 GUARD, GRILL DEBRIS $334 v
451-2645 SCREEN, REAR $2,935
238-1177 COUNTERWEIGHT, ADDITIONAL (3) $8,055 ¥~
428-7447 CYLINDERS, LIFT, BASIC $11,970
539-9136 85U/U BULLDOZER, GUARDED $19,260 ¥~
510-8679 BLADE, 85U LGP LANDFILL W/ WP $41,340 »~
533-5523 PUSH ARMS, SINGLE, EXTREME $15,830 v~
SUB TOTAL $245,907 v~
LESS 21% SHERIFF'S CONTRACT DISCOUNT ($51,640) v~
TOTAL OF NON-SPECIFIED OPTIONS $194,267
NON-CONTRACT OPTIONS
GCCS900 TRIMBLE (INDICATE ONLY) SYSTEM $27,950 «”
INSTALLATION OF TRIMBLE SYSTEM $2,300v"
FQS/BEAR FIRE SUPPRESSION SYSTEM $13,595 «
FQS/BEAR MAINTENANCE CONTRACT $3,000 ¢
SERVICE MANUAL & PARTS BOOK $2,250 +»~
5 YEAR / 7500 HOUR PREMIER WARRANTY 53,093 +»
TOTAL OF NON-CONTRACT OPTIONS $102,188 v~
SUB TOTAL $885,1360"
LESS ONE TIME ADDITIONAL DISCOUNT ($16,274)

TOTAL TRANSACTION PRICE

$868,862 1




Best regards,

Bert Hammett
Vice President / Regional Manager
Ring Power Corporation
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Name of Dealership Type of Vehicle Zone
180 HP BULLDOZER CANOPY TRACTOR (Specification #3
Trekker Tractor 2019 Case 2050M Western
2019 Case 2050M Western
Trekker Tractor 2019 Case 2050M Northern
2019 Case 2050M Northern
Trekker Tractor 2019 Case 2050M Central
2019 Case 2050M Central
Trekker Tractor 2019 Case 2050M Southern
2019 Case 2050M Southern
Ring Power Corporation 2019 Caterpillar D6T Western
2019 Caterpillar D6T Western
Ring Power Corporation 2019 Caterpillar D6T Northern
2019 Caterpillar D6T Northern
Ring Power Corporation 2019 Caterpillar D6T Central
2019 Caterpillar D6T Central
Kelly Tractor Co 2019 Caterpillar D6T Southern
2019 Caterpillar D6T Southern
Dobbs Equipment LLC 2019 John Deere 850K * Western
2019 John Deere 850K Western
Dobbs Equipment LLC 2019 John Deere 850K * Northern
2019 John Deere 850K Northern
Dobbs Equipment LLC 2019 John Deere 850K * Central
2019 John Deere 850K Central
Dobbs Equipment LLC 2019 John Deere 850K * Southern
2019 John Deere 850K Southen

Base Unit
Price

$302,173.00
--NB --
$287,784.00
--NB --
$287,784.00
_-NB --
$287,784.00
--NB --

$341,604.00
--NB --
$341,604.00
--NB --
$341,604.00
--NB --
$324,014.00
--NB --

$284,975.00
--NB --
$284,975.00
--NB --
$284,975.00
--NB --
$284,975.00
--NB --
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180 HP BULLDOZER CANOPY TRACTOR
SPECIFICATION #39

2019 Caterpillar D6T

The Caterpillar D6T purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer for this
model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base price as
awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $341,604.00 $341,604.00 $341,604.00 $324,014.00

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.



VEHICLE:
DEALER:
ZONE:

BASE PRICE:

Order Code

458-3880 !
D6N XL 2

458-3881 !
D6N LGP 2

458-3884 !
458-3882 |

458-3885 !

Order Code

381-7885 |
D6T XW 2

381-7886 |
D6T LGP 2

442-1100 !
D6T XL
VPAT?

474-5751 !
D6T XW
VPAT 2

378-3835 !
D6T LGP
VPAT ?

Ring Power Corporation Ring Power Corporation Ring Power Corporation Kelly Tractor Co

D6T

Western Northern

$341,604.00 $341,604.00
Delete Options

Downgrade option — specify
DOWNGRADE TO D6T XL DS TRACTOR, BASE MACHINE ONLY 1

BASE D6N XL W/FREIGHT & PREP ONLY 2

Downgrade option — specify
DOWNGRADE TO D6T XW TRACTOR, BASE MACHINE ONLY !
BASE D6N LGP W/FREIGHT & PREP ONLY 2

Downgrade option — specify
DOWNGRADE TO D6T XW VPAT, BASE MACHINE ONLY

Delete Option — specify
DOWNGRADE TO D6T LGP, BASE MACHINE ONLY 1

Delete Option — specify
DOWNGRADE TO CAT D6T LGP VPAT, BASE MACHINE ONLY |

Delete Option — specify
Delete Option — specify
Delete Option — specify
Delete Option — specify
Delete Option — specify
Delete Option — specify
Delete Option — specify
Delete Option — specify

Add Options

Upgrade — specify
UPGRADE TO D7E TRACTOR, BASE MACHINE ONLY 1

MODEL UPGRADE TO BASE D6T XW W/FREIGHT & PREP ONLY 2

Upgrade — specify
UPGRADE TO D7E LGP TRACTOR, BASE MACHINE ONLY |

MODEL UPGRADE TO BASE D6T LGP W/FREIGHT & PREP ONLY 2

Optional Equipment — specify
UPGRADE TO D8T TRACTOR, BASE MACHINE ONLY 1

Central Southem
$341,604.00 $324,014.00
Western
& Northern
& Central Southern

($38,997.00)" ($87,399.00)2

($31,819.00)" ($77,007.00)>

($28,408.00)"
($18,977.00)"

($16,887.00)!

Western
& Northern
& Central Southern

$127,725.00' ($18,613.00)°
$164,413.00'  ($5,771.00)?

$247,077.00" ($26,120.00)°

MODEL UPGRADE TO BASE D6T XL VPAT BLADE W/FREIGHT & PREP ONLY 2

Optional Equipment — specify
WASTE HANDLING AR, VPAT 1

$16,797.00' ($15,203.00)*

MODEL UPGRADE TO BASE D6T XW VPAT BLADE W/FREIGHT & PREP ONLY 2

Optional Equipment — specify
FINAL DRIVE, XL VPAT CLAMSHELL |

$11,357.00!  ($3,683.00)°

MODEL UPGRADE TO BASE D6T LGP VPAT BLADE W/FREIGHT & PREP ONLY 2



VEHICLE: D6T

DEALER: Ring Power Corporation Ring Power Corporation Ring Power Corporation Kelly Tractor Co
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southem
BASE PRICE: $341,604.00 $341,604.00 $341,604.00 $324,014.00
475-0213 ! Optional Equipment — spemfy $7,668.00l $1 39,717.002
D7E 2 ENGINE, THERMAL SHIELD 1
MODEL UPGRADE TO BASE D7E W/FREIGHT & PREP ONLY 2
464-3634 ' Optional Equipment — specify $969.00"  $176,299.00°

D7E LGP 2 PRECLEANER, WITH SCREEN 1
MODEL UPGRADE TO BASE D7E LGP W/FREIGHT & PREP ONLY 2

378-3806 | Optional Equipment — specify $12,261.00'  $226,753.00
D7E WASTE UNDERCARRIAGE, §1, FULL GUIDE 1

HANDLING 2 MODEL UPGRADE TO BASE D7E LGP WASTE HANDLING W/FREIGHT & PREP ONLY 2

378-3808 ' Optional Equipment — specify $3,013.00'  $259,666.002

DST 2 UNDERCARRIAGE, HD, PART GUIDE 1
MODEL UPGRADE TO BASE D8T W/FREIGHT & PREP ONLY 2

384-1713 ! Optional Equipment — specxfy $1,505.001 &

21% TRACK, 560MM /22" ES S1

DISCOUNT 2 21% DISCOUNT OFF LIST PRICE ON CAT MODELS D6T, D7E, & D8T. 22% DISCOUNT ON D6N. 2

490-0501 ! Optional Equipment — specify $2,991.00l
HYDRAULICS, WINCH/RIPPER |

513-9346 ! Optional Equipment — spemfy $2,329.001
LIGHTS, 10, PREMIUM |

393-7245'  Optional Equipment — specify $1,179.00"
SEAT, HEATED & VENTILATED

514-0441 ! Optional Equipment — sPecify $9,896.00l
STRIKER BAR BOX, REAR

451-9116! Optional Equipment — specifY $662.00"
HANDLES, HEAVY DUTY, VPAT

509-7665 ! Optional Equipment — spemfy $373.00!
VISIBILITY AR, SINGLE CAMERA ' |

1Z-0994 ! Optional Equlpment specify $8,370.00l
STRIKER BAR, REAR

458-3918 ! Optional Equipment — specxfy $1 ,270.001
FAN, AUTO REVERSING 1

390-9389 ! Optional Equlpment — specify $2,091.001

GUARD, FUEL TANK 1

DISCOUNT ! Optional Equipment — specify
19% DISCOUNT OFF OF D6T TRACTORS; 21% DISCOUNT OFF OF D7E & D8T TRACTORS.
DISCOUNT APPLIES TO ALL OEM NON-SPECIFIED OPTIONS. 16% DISCOUNT ON ALL CAT
WORK TOOLS. |
Temporary Tag
Transfer existing registration

New state tag



VEHICLE:
DEALER:
ZONE:

BASE PRICE:

SERVICE !
3YR/3000HR
PM PKG 2

5YR/5000HR
PM PKG 2

Southern

D6T

Ring Power Corporation Ring Power Corporation Ring Power Corporation Kelly Tractor Co
Western Northern Central

$341,604.00 $341,604.00 $341,604.00

Maintenance plan — specify

PREVENTATIVE MAINTENANCT{ CONTRACTS ARE AVAILABLE. TOTAL MAINTENANCE & REPAIR

CONTRACTS ARE AVAILABLE.

PREVENTATIVE MAINTENANCE FOR 3 YRS OR 3000 HRS AT 500 HR OR 6 MONTH INTERVALS.
PKG INCLUDES 6 TOTAL PM'S. 2

Maintenance plan — specify
PREVENTATIVE MAINTENANCE FOR 5 YRS OR 5000 HRS AT 500 HR OR 6 MONTH INTERVALS.
PKG INCLUDES 10 TOTAL PM'S. 2

Warranty — specify
3 YEAR /5,000 HOUR PREMIER. THERE IS PREMIER WARRANTY AVAILABLE FOR UPGRADED
AND DOWNGRADED MACHINES AS WELL. |

Warranty — specify
5 YEAR /7,500 HOUR POWERTRAIN. THERE IS POWERTRAIN WARRANTY AVAILABLE FOR
UPGRADED AND DOWNGRADED MACHINES AS WELL. 1

$324,014.00

1

$13,756.00"

$13,474.00"

$11,004.00°

$21,494.00%
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180 HP BULLDOZER CANOPY TRACTOR
SPECIFICATION #39

2019 Caterpillar D6T

(Alternate Dealer Option)

The Caterpillar D6T purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer for this
model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base price as
awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE.: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: --No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.



VEHICLE:

DEALER:
ZONE:

D6T (ALTERNATE DEALERS)

Western

BASE PRICE: --No bid --

Order Code

Order Code

Delete Options

Downgrade option — specify
Downgrade option - specify
Downgrade option — specify
Delete Option — specify
Delete Option — specify
Delete Option — specify
Delete Option — specify
Delete Option — specify
Delete Option — specify
Delete Option — specify
Delete Option — specify
Delete Option — specify
Delete Option — specify

Add Options

Upgrade — specify

Upgrade — specify

Optional Equipment — specify
Optional Equipment — specify
Optional Equipment — specify
Optional Equipment — specify
Optional Equipment — specify
Optional Equipment — specify
Optional Equipment — specify
Optional Equipment — specify
Optional Equipment — specify
Optional Equipment — specify
Optional Equipment — specify
Optional Equipment — specify
Optional Equipment — specify
Optional Equipment — specify
Optional Equipment — specify
Optional Equipment — specify
Optional Equipment — specify
Optional Equipment — specify

Northern
-- No bid --

Central
-- No bid --

Southern
-- No bid --

All Zones

All Zones



VEHICLE: D6T (ALTERNATE DEALERS)
DEALER:

ZONE: Western Northern
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid --
Temporary Tag

Transfer existing registration
New state tag

Maintenance plan — specify
Maintenance plan — specify
Warranty — specify
Warranty — specify

Central
-- No bid --

Southern
-- No bid --



