04-17-19

Mr. Barry Byrd
8051 N. Tamiami Trail, Unite #D-8
Sarasota, FL 34243

You are hereby notified that a check, numbered 200, in the face amount of $80.00, issued by you
on 11-22-185, drawn upon Wells Fargo Bank, and payable to Manatee County BCC, has been
dishonored.

Pursuant to Florida law, you have 15 days from the date of this notice to tender payment of the
full amount of such check $80.00 plus a service charge of $30.00 for a total due of $110.00.
Unless this amount is paid in full within 15 days, the holder of such check may turn over the
dishonored check and all other available information relating to this incident to the State Attorney
for criminal prosecution. You may be additionally liable in a civil action for triple the amount of
the check, but in no case less than $50.00, together with the amount of the check, a service
charge, court costs, reasonable attorney fees, and incurred bank fees, as provided in s. 68.065,
F.S.

Payment should be made in cash, money order or cashier's check for $110.00 made payable to:
Manatee County BCC
1112 Manatee Avenue West, Fourth Floor
Bradenton, Florida 34205

When payment in full is made, you will be given a receipt
Sincerely,

Tammy Boggs, Senior Fiscal Services Manager
Building and Development Services Department
(941) 748-4501 X3817

PRISCILLA TRACE  REGGIE BELLAMY  STEPHEN JONSSON _ MISTY SERVIA VANESSA BAUGH CAROL WHITMORE ~ BETSY BENAC
District 1 District 2 District 3 District 4 District 5 At Large At Large



513112019 USPS.com® - USPS Tracking® Results

U S P S TI" ac ki n g® FAQs > (https://www.usps.com/faqgs/uspstracking-faqs.htm)

Track Another Package +

Remove X

Tracking Number: 9414814901027065207248

Your item was delivered to the front desk, reception area, or mail room at 10:23 am on April 23,
2019 in SARASOTA, FL 34243.

7 Delivered

April 23, 2019 at 10:23 am
Delivered, Front Desk/Reception/Mail Room
SARASOTA, FL 34243

Get Updates \/

joeqpasd

Text & Email Updates Vv
Return Receipt Electronic Vv
Tracking History Vv

W

Product Information

See Less A\

Can’t find what you're looking for?

Go to our FAQs section to find answers to your tracking questions.

hittps:fitocls.usps.com/go/TrackConfirmAction7tRef=fuillpage&tl c=2&text28777=8&tLabels=2414814901027065207248%2C 112
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Beverly Lefever

From: Pam Wingo <Pam.Wingo@ManateeClerk.com>
Sent: Monday, December 03, 2018 9:16 AM

To: Beverly Lefever; Julie Jensvold

Ce: Tammy Boggs

Subject: RE: Old NSF Checks

Thank you for the update! Will update the reports—will be sending out this afternoon or tomorrow.

From: Beverly Lefever [mailto:beverly.lefever@mymanatee.org]
Sent: Monday, December 03, 2018 9:10 AM

To: Julie Jensvold

Cc: Tammy Boggs; Pam Wingo

Subject: Old NSF Checks

Good morning!

I was finally able to collect one of our old NSF checks, it's the one from LNJ Group/Brown Dog
Svc in the amount of $553.44 + a $40 NSF fee. This was collected this morning.

I'm still trying to get the ones from Moss Const and Barry Byrd; I'm still trying to collect these
but will write them off at the end of January if I have no luck with them,

Beverly Lefever, Fiscal Specialist
Manatee County Government

Building & Development Services Dept.
1112 Manatee Avenue West, 4th Floor
Bradenton, FL 34205

Phone (941) 748-4501 X3840
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Data Contained In Search Results Is Current As Of 11/21/2018 12:05 PM.

Q)% Search Resulits

Please see our glossary of terms for an explanation of the license status shown in
these search results.

BH For additional information, including any complaints or discipline, click on the name.
Name License
License Type Name T Number/ Status/Expires
Ype
Rank
Certified Building CBC1255547 Current, Active
Contractor ~ BARSADEVELOPMENTLLC DBA 4 giilding 08/31/2020
h 3

Main Address*: 8051 N TAMIAMI TRAIL SARASCTA, FL 34243 \‘ v

Certified Building . CBC1255547 Current, Active
Contractor EYRD, BARRY Primary  cart Bullding 08/31/2020

Main Address*: 8051 N TAMIAMI TRAIL SARASOTA, FL 34243
Bock Y rowsoeer

* denotes ><
6 U?Uﬂds . {lgepddress is the Primary Address on file.
M

iling Address - This is the address where the mail associated with a particular license will be sent (if different from the
Main or License Location addresses).
*License Location }ddress - This is the address where the place of business is physically located.

2601BER Stor ¢ Roa FL 1 Email: Customer Contact Center :: Customer Contact Center: 850.487.1395

https://av3.accela.com/portlets/web/en-us/

Page 1 of 1
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Beverly Lefever

From: Beverly Lefever

Sent: Wednesday, November 21, 2018 1:40 PM
To: ‘BARSADEV@MAC.COM'

Subject: FW: NSF Check #200 - Barry Byrd
Attachments: NSF Check #200 - Barry Byrd.PDF

Good afternoon Mr. Byrd,

This Is our final attempt to give you a chance to take care of this NSF check. We have been
extremely patient but cannot let this go any longer. If you have not paid this by November 30%, we will
have no choice but to turn this over to local Law Enforcement and the State Attorney’s Office for
criminal prosecution. You will then not only be liable for this NSF check and the NSF fee, you may be
additionally liable in a civil action for triple the amount of the check along with court costs, reasonable
attorney fees, and incurred bank fees.

We are no longer able to take credit card payments via credit card authorization forms, you will need
to pay this in person at our offices located at my address below. We will not take a check, only cash,
cashier’s check, money order, credit card.

This email is being sent with a delivery receipt and a read receipt to confirm that you receive
it. Please advise your intentions by return email

Beverly Lefever, Fiscal Specialist
Manatee County Government

Building & Development Services Dept.
1112 Manatee Avenue West, 4th Floor
Bradenton, FL 34205

Phone (941) 748-4501 X3840

From: Beverly Lefever

Sent: Friday, December 08, 2017 3:00 PM

To: 'BARSADEV@MAC.COM' <BARSADEV@MAC.COM>

Cc: Tammy Boggs <tammy.hoggs@mymanatee.org>; Tracy Brainard <tracy.brainard@mymanatee.org>
Subject: NSF Check #200 - Barry Byrd

Good afternoon Mr. Byrd,



I am in the process of trying to clear up old outstanding items and discovered that there is still
an old NSF check that was returned to us that's never been cleared up. I've attached a copy of
the check and a copy of our credit card authorization form for your convenience,

This needs to be handled ASAP, the total of check #200 is $80 and the returned check fee is
$30.00 for a total of $110.00 due us. If you would like to pay this via credit card instead of
coming to our office, you can complete the credit card authorization form and return it to me; I
can process the payment and email you a receipt. If you decide to make payment to us using
this method, please be sure to contact me at my phone number below prior to faxing the
authorization form. If I am not at my desk to answer the phone, please call Tracy Brainard at
(941) 748-4501 x6824 so that one of us can wait at the fax machine for the authorization
form to come through.

If you would prefer, you can come to our Permitting office to clear this up; if you choose to pay
in person in our office, please let the cashier know that you are here to clear an NSF check.

Your contractor license #CBC1255547 is being placed on hold until this is taken care of. Please
contact me and let me know when I can expect payment.

Thanks in advance for your rapid response. Have a great weekend.

Beverly Lefever, Fiscal Specialist
Manatee County Government

Building & Development Services Dept.
1112 Manatee Avenue West, 4th Floor
Bradenton, FL. 34205

Phone (941) 748-4501 X3840

Fax # (941) 749-3098
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Beverly Lefever

10700 CWING DL,

From: Beverly Lefever

Sent: Friday, December 08, 2017 3:00 PM SARA

To: 'BARSADEV@MAC.COM' 8‘} 4 }
Cc: Tammy Boggs; Tracy Brainard

Subject: NSF Check #200 - Barry Byrd

Attachments: CREDIT CARD AUTHORIZATION FORM.pdf; NSF Check #200 - Barry Byrd .PDF

Categories: NSF CHECK INFC

Good afternoon Mr. Byrd,

I am in the process of trying to clear up old outstanding items and discovered that there is still
an old NSF check that was returned to us that's never been cleared up. I've attached a copy of
the check and a copy of our credit card authorization form for your convenience.

This needs to be handled ASAP, the total of check #200 is $80 and the returned check fee is
$30.00 for a total of $110.00 due us. If you would like to pay this via credit card instead of
coming to our office, you can complete the credit card authorization form and return it to me; I
can process the payment and email you a receipt. If you decide to make payment to us using
this method, please be sure to contact me at my phone number below prior to faxing the
authorization form. If I am not at my desk to answer the phone, please call Tracy Brainard at
(941) 748-4501 x6824 so that one of us can wait at the fax machine for the authorization
form to come through.

If you would prefer, you can come to our Permitting office to clear this up; if you choose to pay
in person in our office, please let the cashier know that you are here to clear an NSF check.

Your contractor license #CBC1255547 is being placed on hold until this is taken care of. Please
contact me and let me know when I can expect payment.

Thanks in advance for your rapid response. Have a great weekend.

License 15 suspended

Beverly Lefever, Fiscal Specialist
Manatee County Government

Building & Development Services Dept.
1112 Manatee Avenue West, 4th Floor
Bradenton, FL 34205

Phone (941) 748-4501 X3840

Fax # (941) 749-3098



@ Contractor Information - Update - MANATEE PRODUCTION 8.4 DATABASE AERLnS Ll

.F:'Ie Edit Actions Details Llinks Favorites Help
DS el & sdBELS w2

Conlractor ID* CBC1255547  Status * [T | Comments QUALIFICATION FILE
Qualifier information Company Information
| | Qualifier ] BYRD. BARRY ] Company | BARSA DEVELOPMFNT{IC
Use Defaull Use Default || HardCony CUrLAn
| Address Other - 10700 LEAFWING DR 4 Address Other - 8051 N TAMIAMI TRL UN D-8
| Ciy/State/Zip SARASOTA FL City/State/Zip  SARASOTA
Phone Home - (341) 9320931 Phone Business - (941) 932-0921
Email Home - BARSADEV@MAC.COM Ld\ \ Notes 10
Birthdate SSN N O Escrow Info Positive balances only [v] [
| License Information iﬁsutance Ihfdi‘maﬁdn .E;aﬁne_d_al.d-s_-
License Registration
License Type BLDG BUILDING CONT Registration Expires
License Number  CBC 1255547 State |CBC1255547 08/31/2018 22]
Issue Date 12072014 13 County JE}
Expiration Date 09/30/2016 i3
QOccupation License FEIN 204924538
||._ Contractor status cades

Bor.  Deselopement — a85-3R13

1600 ML%%Q\ Ve
SaRoseskdy 3431 3uyy

Licepse Las been Susf)end&d-



BANK OF AMERICA, N.A. Page 001 of 001 H

EAST RETURN ITEMS Bank r 00075
Center

Divider: 836
Code i1 3B

Deposit account:xxxxxxxxxx4595

i, Charge account 1xxxxxxxxxx4595

Store/Reforence:00000000000999
xxxx MANATEE COUNTY xxxx
e DOWNTOWN BRADENTON

FL4-248-01-01 DESK #06

3333322333 22333332323233823323

Date of Notice: 11-30-2015
Dear Valued Customer:

We're writing to notify vou that the item or items listed bolow, which were deposited
into your account have been returned unpaid. As a result, we've deducted them from vour
account. Fees for analyzed accounts are itemized on the account analvsis statement.

Number of returned items: 1
Amount of returned item(s): 80.00
Sequence/ ABA Number/ Maker MName/ Return Reason/ Amount
Dep Date Dep Amount Check Date Additional Data
2035259933 04631-0751 Not Sufficient Funds 80.00
1172372015 110,583.14
' nSF Fee 30.00

o
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1330128228 NSF
11/30/2015 't
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Sincerely,

Returns & Exceptians

WK



MANATEE COUNTY

ITEM 1 QOF 1 PERMIT RECEIPT OPERATOR: blefever
COPY # : 1

Sec:12 Twp:355 Rng:17E Sub:0000000 Blk: Lot :MBLL

PARCEL ID ........: 5601400152

DATE ISSUED.......: 11/23/2015

RECEIPT #.........: 30000011849

REFERENCE ID # ...: 15111510

SITE ADDRESS .....: 1105 53RD AVE E

SUBDIVISION ......: NOT IN SUBDIVISION 0/0

T I - B (S

IMPACT AREA ......: CSW

OWNER ............: HOWZE, SHARCN B

ADDRESS ..........: 5406 26TH ST W

CITY/STATE/ZIP ...: BRADENTON, FL 34207-3169

RECEIVED FRCM ....: BYRD, BARRY

CONTRACTCR .......: BYRD, BARRY LIC # CBC1255547

COMPANY ..........: BARSA DEVELOPMENT LLC

ADDRESS ..........: 8051 N TAMIAMI TRL UN D-8

CITY/STATE/ZIP ...: SARASOTA, FL 34243

TELEPHONE ........: (941) 932-0921

Notes ............: 300000118459

FEE ID UNIT QUANTITY AMOUNT PD-TO-DT THIS REC NEW BAL

ALT COMM SQUARE FOOT 600.00 338.00 0.00 80.00 258.00
TOTAL PERMIT : 338.00 0.00 80.00 258.00
METHOD OF PAYMENT AMOUNT REFERENCE NUMBER
CHECK/MONEY ORDER 80.00 200
TOTAL RECEIPT : 80.00



Barsa Development LLC Contact Information

Q Baria Development LLC Address: 800 8 Tsmianu Til Unit 407, Sarasota, FL 34243

Barsa Development LLC Sarasota

Quality
Hovw is the BuildZoom score caloulined?
Pru tip: We generally recormmend hiting a contractor with
86 a score higher then 95,
718t peicentibe Batia Develapment LLC has o BuildZoom seare of BS,

which places them above 21% of 191,428 contractors in
Florida.

BARSA DEVELOPMENT LLC LICENSE INFO

w VERIFIED LICENSE

License # CBC1255547

Statua Actlve

State Florida

Type Cartlfied Building Co
ntractar

BuldZeom varifiad this kcense was active
a3 of Septamber 2017

Voufy this ligenze’s status for Barsa
Davalopraant LLC at tha Florida
Cepartmant of Businass & Professional
Regulatian



Beverly Lefever

From: Internet Mail Delivery <postmaster@ms02604.mac.com>
To: BARSADEV@MAC.COM

Sent: Friday, December 08, 2017 3:00 PM

Subject: Undeliverable: NSF Check #200 - Barry Byrd

This report reiates to a message you sent with the following header fields:
Message-id:

<DM5PR0O9MB141701370689493A39A3DD52FB300@DM5PR0OOMB 1417 .namprd09.prod.outlook.co
m=

Date: Fri, 08 Dec 2017 20:00:17 +0000

From: Beverly Lefever <beverly.lefever@mymanatee.org>

To: "BARSADEV@MAC.COM" <barsadev@mac.com>

Subject: NSF Check #200 - Barry Byrd

Your message cannot be delivered to the following recipients: &

Recipient address: BARSADEV@MAC.COM
Reason: Over quota



Beverly Lefever

T
From; Internet Mail Delivery <postmaster@ms02604. mac.com>
To: barsadev@mac.com
Sent: Friday, December 08, 2017 3.04 PM
Subject: Undeliverable: NSF Check #200 - Barry Byrd

This report relates to a message you sent with the following header fields:
Message-id:

<DM5PR0OSMB141779A86500ACDAG656137FEFB300@DM5PROSMB1417.namprd09.prod.outlook.c
om>

Date: Fri, 08 Dec 2017 20:02.:26 +0000

From: Beverly Lefever <beverly.lefever@mymanatee.org>

To: "barsadev@mac.com" <barsadev@mac.com>

Subject: FW: NSF Check #200 - Barry Byrd

Your message cannot be delivered to the following recipients:

Recipient address: barsadev@mac.com
Reason: Over quota





